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The purpose of the assembly
('` d''l) :l−¥̀ ẍ §U ¦i i¬¥p §A z²©c£rÎlM̈Îz«¤̀  d À¤WŸn l´¥d §w©I©e&
"Moshe assembled the entire assembly of Klal Yisrael,” The

obvious question is posed, why did Moshe have to assemble
the Yidden? Also why did he have to assemble the entire
Klal Yisroel? The answer can be, we find in the Pervious
Parsha, Parshas Ki Sisa that after the Yidden sinned with the
golden calf lbr , Hashem said: ”Every man put his sword etc.

let every man kill his brother”. On that day about three
thousand people fell. This caused a great rift, anger and
hatred between the Yidden. Therefore Moshe wanted to
bring Klal Yisrael together again. That’s the reason he
assembled the entire assembly and spoke to them, and
explained that what had happened was a command of
Hashem and it was for their benefit.  This assembly brought

back Ahavas Yisroel to each other. (iwqipyc u"ixdn zxez)

Announcing pledges for Tzdakah is beneficial
 :xŸ «n`¥l 'd d¬Ë ¦vÎx ¤W£̀  x ½̈aC̈ ©d df)(ws  vwwk

“This is the word that Hashem commanded, saying.” The
Rashba (From the Rishonim) in his responsa 582, derives from
this Posuk, the source that by an appeal for Tzedaka we
should announce in Public the names of the donors and the
amount they pledged. Even though we find in chazal that
Tzedaka shall be Matan Besaser, very low key. However
when giving in public we should announce it. This is what
the Posuk means when it says, “This is the word”, when
giving Tzedaka, Hashem commanded. xŸ «n` ¥l we should say

(announce) it in public to. This can bring about that others
will learn from it and follow suit so the mitzvah that one

does will be the mxeb / the catalyst for other people's Tzedaka.

This alludes to the gemarra Baba Basra 9a kusd rzgkt r"t
 rntba vaugv in r,uh vagnv(zh 'ck uvhgah)vesmv vagn vhvu 

ouka Rabbi Elazar says: One who causes others to perform

[me’aseh] a meritorious act is greater than one who

performs that act himself, as it is stated: “And the causing

[ma’aseh] of righteousness shall be peace, and the work of

righteousness, quietness, and assurance forever” (Isaiah
32:17) This is another reason to announce pledges in public
as it will cause other people to give and the Navi Yeshaya
promises peace to you for this great deed/

Making every minute count when doing HashemÊs workMaking every minute count when doing HashemÊs workMaking every minute count when doing HashemÊs workMaking every minute count when doing HashemÊs work
 :x ¤wŸA ©A x ¤wŸA ©A däc̈ §p cŸer eil̈ ¥̀  E`i ¦a ¥d m ¥d §e(d uk)

they brought him more gifts every morning.(36:3) The
Leipniker Gaon, Rav Baruch Frankel the Boruch Ta’am
asks: Why is it that exactly what the Bnei Yisroel brought to
the Mishkan is not spelled out in the Posuk. All it states is

they brought him more gifts every morning?  The Gaon
comments a powerful lesson from these workers. We know
that according to the Halacha a workman may use time paid
by his employer for meals and for davening. But the
craftsman who constructed the Mishkan were not ordinary
labourers. They did not wish to subtract productive time
from their workday, even if it were permitted. They basked
in the holiness and enjoyed every minute of the aura of
kedusha. Therefore, they all arrived early in the morning,
having already eaten, so as not to lose time from their holy
labour. So now we can explain the posuk: m ¥d §e they the holy

workmen brought an additional intangible gift ' cŸer eil̈ ¥̀  E`i ¦a ¥d

däc̈ §p that is: their enthusiasm in arriving early to work every

morning– , x¤wŸA ©A x ¤wŸA ©A fully sated with food, so  as not to lose

productive time from the Mishkan’s construction. [This is a
true lesson. When one comes to Shul early before davening
or before the time of learning, this is an intangible gift to
Hashem. This demonstrates your love in serving Him.   /

)(mrh jexad mya mixwi mipipt

No embarrassment by  donations to the MishkanNo embarrassment by  donations to the MishkanNo embarrassment by  donations to the MishkanNo embarrassment by  donations to the Mishkan
x ¥zFd §e Dz̈Ÿ̀  zFU£r ©l dk̈`l̈ §O ©dÎlk̈ §l mÏ ©c dz̈ §id̈ dk̈`l̈ §O ©d §e(z uk) :

   "The work done was sufficient and there was extra"(36:7)         

When Moshe saw that more than enough materials had been

provided for the Mishkan, he called a halt to the

contributions The verse states that "there was

sufficient///there was more than needed/" The Ohr Hachaim

poses a question: these two expressions seem to contradict

each other` if there was sufficient, then how could there at the

same time be extra? Secondly' why is there a need at all to

mention that there was a surplus? He answers that in order to

prevent those who brought the surplus from being

embarrassed by having their donations returned' a miracle

occurred and the surplus materials became incorporated into

the Mishkan and its vessels /This teaches us an inspiring

lesson/ The Gemara mentions many times that Hashem does

not make a miracle unless there is a genuine need for that

miracle/ At this stage in our history' Klal Yisrael banded

together' rich and poor alike' with everyone donating to the

Mishkan/ Since the Mishkanws mission' as it were' was

predicated on unityqachdus among Klal Yisroel' there could

not have been be the slightest cause to have someone feel

embarrassed' as that could damage and cause serious

disunity/ Therefore Hashem purposely performed the miracle

of absorbing all donations into the Mishkan' and everyone

was gratified that his donation was being used for its proper

purpose (Yehuda Z. Klitnick)
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Story of the week (By Yehuda Z. Klitnick) 

******The  Vorkar Rebbe  softens the heart  of  a stingy rich Yid*****
Harav Hatzadik Reb Yitzchok Kalish of Vorka 

 l''wevf [5539-5608] was a Talmid of Reb Simcha Bunim
Bonhart, Rebbe of Peshischa. He was also a close friend of
the Chidushei Harim of Gur. Both worked tirelessly to help
other Yidden. Reb Yitzchok was renowned to have an
influence on many people. Even assimilated Jews formed a
close bond with the Rebbe. The Rebbe used to travel often to
Warsaw to be with his Chassidim for Shabbos. Once, a
chosid of the Rebbe who was very poor and had to marry off
a child came to the Rebbe with a problem. “I have a cousin
who is very wealthy and is able to help me with money,”
said the chosid, “yet, his servants won't allow anyone to
come near him!” "How much money do you need?" asked
the Rebbe. As soon as the chosid named a sum of one
hundred rubles and gave his cousin’s address, the Rebbe
himself was off to the rich cousin’s house. “With the help of
Hashem, we will get one hundred rubbles from your cousin.”
said the Rebbe. 

“Who is asking to see my master?” asked the servant
at the door. In a few moments, the servant returned to say
that his master had no dealings with the Rebbe of Vorka.
Hence, the Rebbe returned empty-handed to the chosid at the
host’s house. “One hundred rubles is not simple to get. We
must have Bitachon and faith that Hashem will help us!”
said he to the dismayed chosid. The next day the Rebbe
again went and knocked on the wealthy man’s door. This
time the rich cousin himself answered the door. Upon seeing
his visitor, with great anger he shouted at the Rebbe to leave
him alone, and slammed the door shut. Once again, the
Rebbe placated the chosid and promised him that with
Hashem’s help they will have the money a day later. Sadly,
the story repeated itself the next day again. The Rebbe
knocked, “Reb Yid,” yelled the enraged cousin” either you
will leave peacefully or I will throw you out!” Calmly, the
Rebbe went back to the awaiting chosid. Although he hadn’t
succeeded yet, the Rebbe reassured the chosid that soon he
would have the needed amount of money. The chosid
believed his Rebbe and promised to be patient.  
     Meanwhile, in Warsaw there was a Jewish activist named
Mattias Rosen, who even though was an assimilated Jew,
helped many Yidden. This Mr. Rosen had a special respect
for the Vorka Rebbe and would “go through fire and water”
to help him. It so happened, that Mr. Rosen and the Chosid’s

rich cousin frequented the same club. Proudly, the cousin
told Mr. Rosen how a Rebbe came to him thrice for Tzedaka,
and what a treatment he received! Upon hearing that it was
the Vorka Rebbe, Mr. Rosen fired back: "Do you know who
you started up with? If you don't go soon to beg forgiveness,
I am afraid for your life! Besides, I will not talk to you again
until you beg forgiveness from the Rebbe. You should give
him whatever he asks from you!"   The rich cousin became
pale and frightened realizing the seriousness of his offence.
“How can I ask forgiveness now?” he asked. “The Rebbe is
a warm and forgiving person. Send a coach to pick up the
Rebbe, and he will come to you,” advised him Mr. Rosen.

The next day a coach wagon stopped at the home of
the   Rebbe's host. A servant came out to bring his master’s
bidding, kindly requesting the Rebbe to return to the wealthy
man’s house. As predicted, the Rebbe consented and went
along with the servant. On the way to the rich man, the
Rebbe thought to himself that although initially he was only
going to ask for 100 rubles, the hassle and belittlement he
went through, deserves an extra hundred rubles.
Additionally, the Rebbe thought, one hundred rubles would
barely cover the chosid’s needs, but with two hundred
rubles, there will be a comfortable chasuna and a bit left over
for the chosid to live on.

When the Rebbe arrived, the rich cousin begged for
the Rebbes forgiveness, with tears streaming down his face.
Now, the man was ashamed to have treated the Vorka Rebbe
the way he did. Now, he was willing to give as much
Tzedaka to the Rebbe as would request. “I forgive you,”
replied the Rebbe. “The truth is that I wanted you to help
your cousin with one hundred rubles to marry off his child,
but after all that transpired I’m requesting you give two
hundred rubles for the cause!”
- "Of course, I will bring the Rebbe the amount right away,"
exclaimed the relieved tycoon. Two hundred rubles
exchanged hands and the Rebbe thanked the man. -
"Your patience and Bitachon in Hashem was rewarded with
receiving double your request,” explained the Rebbe. The
Rebbe handed over the enormous sum to his chosid. The
Rebbe wasn’t swayed by the arrogance of a rich person.
When time comes to help a fellow Yid, we must do all we
can to assist and not be turned off by small obstacles.

  A special Mazel Tov to my grandson Yitzchok Kessler  i''p on his Bar Mitzvah this Shabbos. To my son in
law Reb Chaim Mayer   i''p and my Mechuten Reb Binyamin Kessler `''hily  and to my dear father Reb
Lazer Klitnick `''hily
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